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INTRODUCTION 

The topic is chosen in this article, not so much 

will arouse people's interest, as imply a strong 

reverse thinking in which. Yes, almost everyone 

would think that as long as to have mastered 

truth, they can use it to identify the authenticity 

of everything in the world. But as far as truth is 

concerned, who can say it clear? This means 

that this article should first clarify what is truth, 

how to determine it and give examples, but the 

difficulty lies in how to be convincing. The term 

"truth" in this article, unless otherwise noted, 

refers to absolute (eternal) truth. For example, in 

reality, everything is always in the process of 

change, and the only constant is the change 

itself. 

As the argument of this article, this is a truth. 
That is to say, truth must have absoluteness and 

immutability, and does not exist in reality. If 

truth does not exist in reality, so how will 

people use it to identify things in the world? 
This is precisely where the bright spot of the 

research lies. 

THE ASCRIPTION AND CHARACTERISTICS OF 

TRUTHS 

"Blind Men and the Elephant," the parable came 

from ancient Indian Buddhist scriptures
 [1]

, it 
warned us to be not able to use one-sided view 

to treat overall problem. Or else, there would be 

a state of endless debates that each airs his own 

views. In reality, such mistakes often occur. The 
reason is that the debaters put themselves in the 
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midst of the event, so it is difficult to look 

throughout the panorama clearly. Just as 
Chinese poet Sushi (AD 1037-1101) said, "I see 

not the true face of Lushan Mountain because I 

am in the midst of the mountain." This parable 
may seem simple, but the philosophy implied in 

it is very profound. Because the "elephant" in 

the parable refers to the "Tao" in the Appendix 

III (Section I ) of the Book of Changes 
[2]

, which 
represents all human knowledge (i.e. all the 

knowledge). These knowledge should cover all 

areas: known and unknown, being and non-
being, changing and unchanged, right and 

wrong, as well as groundless or specious. 

This means that the various descriptions aimed 
at the "Tao" in Tao Te Ching by Lao Tzu can be 

correspond to "all the knowledge" defined in 

this article 
[3]

. Which should have great 

significance to unify the Eastern and Western 
Philosophy, and it is hoped that more 

consensuses will be formed based on this. 

Using Aristotle's definition for reference and 
distinguishing different definition domains 

according to whether it exists in reality, all the 

knowledge can be divided into three parts: 

natural science, metaphysics and mathematics
[4]

. 
The word "metaphysics" was converted from 

Japanese into Chinese. Aristotle defined it as 

"first philosophy", also known as "theology". 
Yan Fu (AD 1854-1921), a Chinese scholar, 

also once translated it into "mysticism." This 

means that in the philosophical category, any 
reference to terms such as the first philosophy, 

theology or mysticism should be considered to 

refer to metaphysics. The contents contained in 

metaphysics, such as ontology, axiom, 
postulation, absolute motion, etc., can be called 

as the truths. Which should have absoluteness 

and immutability, and have existed only just in 
order to the existence of natural science, but do 

not exist in reality. That is to say, the natural 

science is all knowledge except metaphysics and 
mathematics. Therefore, the distinction between 

natural science and metaphysics can be made on 

according to whether there exists in reality. And 

the principle of seeking limit in mathematics, 
has helped us to break through the bondage of 

finite thought by the way of infinite subdivision, 

from the quantitative change in real space has 
gone deep into the qualitative change of ideal 

realm. That is to say, mathematics runs 

throughout the both, not only has achieved the 

unity of opposites of all the knowledge, but can 
also make reasoning under the premise of 

mutual restriction according to have the 

characteristic of continuity. 

According to the definition of seeking limit in 

mathematics, when the independent variable of 
a function tends to infinity or exceeds its 

definition domain, the function has a limit value. 

The necessary condition is to have continuity. 
The independent variable continuously changes 

in its definition domain and makes the function 

close to its limiting value, which is the process 

to seek the limit. As an abstraction of things in 
reality, this process can correspond to a relative 

motion in real physical space. The physical 

meaning here is the process that in the long-term 
and repeated the test of practice, human beings 

continually to modify the one-sided view to 

approach an absolute motion. 

When the frequencies of approach nearly tend to 

infinite, the difference between the obtained 

conclusion and the absolute motion can be 

arbitrarily small, so between the two can be 
considered to be continuous. The absolute 

motion corresponds to the limit value of the 

function, which has absoluteness and 
immutability, does not exist in reality, and 

belongs to the category of metaphysics. 

That is to say, as long as it is the truth, such as 

ontology, axiom, postulation, absolute motion, 
etc., which must not be obtained by empirical 

methods in reality, and can only be approached 

gradually. 

THE METAPHYSICS DOES NOT REALLY 

DISENGAGE FROM PRACTICE 

The philosophy of materialism believes that 
metaphysics is of disengaging from practice, 

and observes objective things with a one-sided, 

isolated and static way of thinking. But now, 

this concept should be reconsidered. Because we 
have realized that this process of seeking and 

obtaining the limit value in mathematics, its 

physical meaning is in order to set up a bridge 
between the relative motion in real physical 

space and the absolute motion beyond that 

space. That is to say, when we look at objective 
things based on the perspective of all the 

knowledge, we will find that the materialism 

can correspond to the natural science, and the 

idealism can correspond to the metaphysics. 
They belong to different defining domains 

respectively, that is, the existence and non-

existence in reality. This means that as long as 
we can clearly redivide the respective contents 

of the materialism and idealism, as well as the 

defining domains in which is the two belonged, 

thereby they will become into a unity of 
opposites with the help of mathematics. Only in 

this way the law of nature can be conformed, 
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that is, everything in reality must be a unity of 

opposites or made up of that. As a result, the 
metaphysics has been transformed into neither 

disengaging from practice, nor just observing 

objective things with a one-sided, isolated and 
static way of thinking. 

Not only that, we should also realize that the 

metaphysics is indispensable and is used by 

everyone. For example, when two people 
described an event with each other and achieved 

a consensus on the natural number "5", in the 

sub-consciousness deep inside each one of their 
hearts, instinctively confirmed the natural 

number "5" and achieved a consensus of 

absolute no error. And this consensus of 
absolute no error, can only be the ontology of 

the natural number "5". From this it can be seen 

that we often use the ontology of each natural 

number, just do not deliberately reflect on. 

The ontology, can also be called as "thing in 

itself" or "Ding an sich", which has absoluteness 

and immutability, does not exist in reality, and 
belongs to the category of metaphysics. No 

matter who, in the sub-consciousness deep 

inside his (her) heart, would use it frequently. If 

seriously to reflect on, but cannot describe its 
form. But if you don't pass the ontology to 

confirm the natural number "5", according to the 

axiom that there is only likeness but no absolute 
identical in reality, so there must be an error 

between the two. In that way, they would not be 

able to achieve a consensus of absolute no error, 
as a result is that there must be ambiguity for the 

event described by each other. 

Today's philosophy, is full of factions, with 

blurred boundaries, and in a state of endless 
debates that each airs his own views. This 

precisely shows that in the processes of thinking 

and pursuing truths, most people have not 
achieved a consensus on what should be the 

(absolute) truth. So there would be ambiguities, 

and using the "blind people touching elephants" 
to do parable should be not at all excessive. For 

example, both materialism and idealism admit 

the existence of matter and consciousness, but 

the question is which comes first? It is precisely 
where the fundamental disagreement between 

materialism and idealism lies. In fact, the key to 

the disagreement lies in that the definition 
domains of the two are not reasonably divided, 

so that the confusion occurs and cannot be self-

knowledge. If according to the aforementioned 

division of all the knowledge, the consciousness 
of the natural sciences type corresponds to the 

materialism, and the consciousness of the 

metaphysics type corresponds to the idealism, 

there will be no disagreement between the two. 

First of all, comparing matter with the 

consciousness of the natural science type, even 

if there is a disagreement on which comes first, 
it can only be regarded as the internal affair of 

the materialism itself, and has been nothing to 

do with the idealism. Moreover, the idealism has 

existed only just in order to the existence of the 
materialism, so there is only indirect continuity 

between the matter and the idealism, and no 

direct comparison can be made, and so there 
will be no disagreement on which comes first. 

Of course, there is continuity between the 

materialism and the idealism, which can be 
compared with each other and also take on 

logically causal, but there can never be any 

chronological relationship. That is to say, things 

in reality are always in the process of change, 
there is not only logical sequence but also 

chronological relationship. But you cannot use 

them to compare in chronological order with 
those eternal and invariable ontologies in the 

metaphysics, because time is only applied to 

physical space in reality and is a standard of 

measuring change. 

THERE CAN NEVER BE ANY 

CHRONOLOGICAL RELATIONSHIP BETWEEN 

TRUTHS 

The ontology, is the ultimate abstraction of the 

essence of objective things in reality, which has 

absoluteness and immutability, does not exist in 
reality, and belongs to the category of 

metaphysics. 

Under this premise, between each of ontologies 

can only be through objective things in reality to 
establish relationships. There can be logical 

causal relationships, but there can never be any 

chronological relationship. For example, a 
chicken lays eggs and the eggs hatch chickens, 

chicken and egg are two things that have causal 

relationship in reality. So, whether is there a 
chicken first, or is there an egg first? 

This problem is similar to the fundamental 

disagreement between materialism and idealism 

mentioned above, as long as the definition 

domains can be divided according to whether it 

exists in reality, a satisfactory explanation can 

be obtained. The first thing to confirm is 

whether the "chicken" and "egg" in this question 

refer to their each ontology or objective 

existence. In the case of ontology, between the 

two can be through objective existence to 

establish logical causal relationships, but there 
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can never be any chronological relationship. 

Therefore, only between the real chickens and 

eggs, which can be to exist in chronological 

relationships. Because time is irreversible in 

reality, which is also an axiom. Therefore, now 

that two things with causal relationship have a 

logical sequence, so there must be a time delay, 

of course, there also must be a chronological. 

That is to say, nothing is eternal in reality, and 

all things cannot go back to their own past. 

Moreover, there is only likeness but no absolute 

identical in reality, which is also an axiom. 

Therefore, all kinds of the chickens and eggs, 

chickens and chickens, eggs and eggs, which 

have with causal relationships, between them 

there are only similarity but no absolute 

identical. The process of their generation, 

evolution and even decline is irreversible, and 

must be from generation to generation in 

chronological order to be presented in front of 

us. This means that if you have to ask, whether 

was a chicken or an egg at the earliest? It 

depends on whether there has been human at 

that time, because the research object in this 

article is only for all the human knowledge. If 

there were no humans at that time, we would 

research those animals that had not evolved into 

humans, how they viewed those "chickens and 

eggs", which have become radically different 

from the present and even their appellations 

were different. Some people would ask that you 

said "a satisfactory explanation can be 

obtained", why has the answer not been seen? In 

fact, as I mentioned above, the truth belongs to 

the category of metaphysics, which does not 

exist in reality, and can only be approached 

gradually. When the difference between the 

obtained conclusion and the truth can be 

arbitrarily small, the answer will appear in front 

of you. Which is precisely the initial argument 

about the truth in this article, that is, in reality 

there is neither eternal chicken nor eternal egg, 

only eternal change. The advent of the chickens 

and eggs must undergo a process from 

quantitative change to qualitative change, by the 

same rules, the disappearance of the chickens 

and eggs also must undergo another process 

from quantitative change to qualitative change. 

The foregoing is according to whether it does 

exist in reality to divide all the knowledge into 

three parts, natural science, metaphysics and 

mathematics. Among them, the truth must have 

absoluteness and immutability, does not exist in 

reality, and belongs to the category of 

metaphysics. 

The characteristic of the truths is that they 

cannot be proved by empirical methods, and can 
only be gradually approached by the long-term 

and repeated practices. When the frequencies of 

approach nearly tend to infinite, the difference 
between the obtained conclusion and the truth 

can be arbitrarily small, so between the two can 

be considered to be continuous. This means that 

the principle of seeking limits in mathematics 
was abstracted from the physical processes of 

ascertaining truths. 

Therefore, it is necessary to reiterate the 
following axiom that the changes of anything in 

reality have continuity. This axiom can also be 

called as the principle of inertia, that is, the 
development of anything has a tendency to 

maintain its state just a moment ago. This is the 

basis of reasoning in reality, and can also be 

called as the necessary condition. Of course, it is 
also a necessary condition to establish causality. 

The evolution of everything in the universe, 

which is precisely a process from quantitative 
change to qualitative change based on that. 

BY VIRTUE OF TRUTHS TO RESTRICT 

AUTHORITATIVE THEORIES 

Reasoning also includes comparisons with the 
changes of objective things in reality or their 

related experiences. As for each kind of 

knowledge belonging to the category of 
metaphysics, such as ontology, axiom and 

absolute motion, etc., if not through the 

objective things in reality, there is no continuity 
between them, so that cannot be reasoned, nor 

can generate any causal relationship. That is to 

say, between them can only be reasoned through 

objective things in reality having continuity, and 
can generate causal relationships, but there can 

never be any chronological relationship. In view 

of the immutability and absoluteness that they 
have, there should be no contradiction between 

the causes and consequences of reasoning. Once 

this happens, the reasoning process should first 
be checked and would try to find out what's 

wrong therein. If there is no error in the process 

of reasoning, it means that there is a problem in 

determining a truth among them, and must be 
corrected. 

Based on this, we can restrict those authoritative 

theories by virtue of the truths to ensure that 
they can be applied reasonably and credibly. 

For example, in Einstein's special relativity, 

there is a paradox, that is, using one truth (the 

principle of constant light velocity in vacuum) 
to overthrow another truth (the absoluteness of 
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simultaneity), thus colliding with the above 

philosophical principle. After careful inspection, 
it is determined that the value c of light speed in 

vacuum from Maxwell's electromagnetic theory 

has been replaced with the value v of real light 
speed. Here lay Einstein's mistake precisely

 [4]
. 

By a statement in Einstein's later years (in 

1948)
[5]

: "The 'principle of relativity' in its 

widest sense is contained in the statement: The 
totality of physical phenomena is of such a 

character that it gives no basis for the 

introduction of the concept of 'absolute motion'; 
or shorter but less precise: There is no absolute 

motion." We can comprehend his cognition of 

the relativity he himself created and the whole 
of physics. 

This statement referred specifically to that in 

real physical space there was only relative 

motion and no absolute motion. In this regard, 
Einstein was not wrong. But he didn't realize 

that absolute motion was the limit value of 

relative motion of real physical space, and there 
was continuity between them, of course, this 

was precisely where the truth lay. This means 

that as long as it is appropriately modified, you 

can get a correct statement: "The 'principle of 
relativity' in its widest sense is contained in the 

statement: The totality of physical phenomena is 

of such a character that all of them do the 
utmost to supply the bases for the introduction 

of the concept of 'absolute motion'; or shorter 

but less precise: Absolute motion must be 
introduced."

[4]
  

"light always propagates in empty space with a 

definite velocity V that is independent of the 

state of motion of the emitting body." This was 
Einstein's statement on the "principle of constant 

light velocity in vacuum" when he created the 

special relativity in 1905
[6]

. Thereinto the 
"empty space" refers to a void that had nothing 

at all, and the same meaning as the "vacuum." 

And the "definite velocity V" is equivalent to 
the value c of light speed in vacuum. Strictly 

speaking, if solely based on Einstein's this 

statement, you can't pick out any mistake. As for 

how did he understand? We should not only 
listen to what he said, but also carefully observe 

what he did. As an absolute reference point, the 

value c of light speed in vacuum should be just 
higher an arbitrarily small value than the highest 

light speed in reality. Because only in this way, 

it is possible to satisfy the condition "that is 

independent of the state of motion of the 
emitting body." But it was a great pity! 

Although Einstein put the value c of light speed 

in vacuum as a base point to use repeatedly in 

his special relativity, but he was determined to 

"gives no basis for the introduction of the 
concept of 'absolute motion'." Therefore, he was 

only able to use a value of light speed in reality 

to instead. At this moment, he didn't seem to 
know that a truth had been violated by himself, 

because there were only similarity but no 

absolute identical, between the values of any 

two real light speeds. Without an absolute 
reference point, even if the value of the highest 

light speed in reality was used to instead, there 

must be an arbitrary small error. Just as 
mentioned above, if without passing the 

ontology to confirm the consensus on the natural 

number "5", there must be an error. And the 
same thing is true here, after a series of 

reasoning, the obtained conclusion will also 

generate ambiguity. Thereupon, such as a 

photon without mass but with energy, length 
contraction and time dilation, and so on, a series 

of paradoxes had been deduced out. 

BE SURE TO DISCREET WHEN CHALLENGING 

A TRUTH  

In view of Einstein had determined on not 

introducing the concept of absolute motion in 

his principle of relativity, even if used the value 
of the highest light speed in reality instead of the 

value c of light speed in vacuum, when v=c, he 

also had to face an awkward situation, that was, 
the denominator of the Lorentz transformation's 

expansion factor 𝛾 =1/ 1− v2/c2  was equal to 

zero. 

From this, it had to be deduced that a photon 

had no mass but had energy. This was not so 

much a conclusion as a paradox. Even he 
himself was too shy to speak out, so had to find 

other way to make up for it. Thereupon, in order 

to get rid of the awkward situation mentioned 

above, nor was it surprising that he questioned 
the absoluteness of simultaneity. He alleged 

that
[7]

: "to speak of the simultaneity of two 

events had no meaning except in relation to a 
given coordinate system." Thus it can be seen 

that he did not know the characteristics of the 

truth at that time, which could not use empirical 
methods to be proven or disproven, and can only 

be approached gradually. Thereupon, in the 

special relativity created by himself, he used the 

mathematical expression of Lorentz's coordinate 
transformation to replace that of Galileo's 

coordinate transformation, thereby "deriving" 

out a speed transformation's formula that 
seemed to be independent of the Lorentz 

transformation's expansion factor 𝛾 [4]
. But the 

above awkward situation still existed, because 
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the expansion factor was closely related to the 

kinetics formulas of his special relativity
 [8]

. 
After that, a photon had no mass but had energy, 

this paradox that he himself was too shy to 

speak out, was called as an inference of 
Einstein's special relativity by some of his 

followers. 

The absoluteness of simultaneity is also a truth, 

which cannot be obtained by means in reality, 
and can only be approached gradually. In the 

face of the truth, Einstein should have 

reconsidered and realized that the value c of 
light speed in vacuum was an absolute motion, 

and it must be just higher an arbitrarily small 

value than the highest light speed in reality. 
Only in this way, the denominator of the above 

Lorentz transformation's expansion factor 𝛾 

would be sure to greater than 0. This meant that 

the mathematical expression of the Galileo's 
coordinate transformation would be still 

applicable. 

Otherwise, if wanted to get rid of the awkward 
situation described above, everything he did was 

in vain. The facts were indeed so. According to 

Einstein's train of thought of no absolute 

motion, if wanted to prove his principle of 
relativity, he must use the means in reality to 

achieve "simultaneity". 

But Einstein didn't know that it would be 
impossible to achieve the absolute simultaneity 

by the means in reality. In other words, this 

belonged to that he had deceived himself first, 
only then did he went to deceive others. 

Therefore, in allusion to the paradoxes deduced 

from this, such as the length contraction and 

time dilation as well as a photon without mass 
but with energy and so on, most of his followers 

were also deeply trapped here, and in a state of 

endless debates that each aired his own views. 

The value c of light speed in vacuum is an 

absolute motion beyond real space and a 

limiting value of speed in the universe. In 

reality, no matter what means we use, the 
experimental results obtained can only gradually 

approach, but cannot be equal to this limit value. 

For example, at the 17th CGPM (General 
Conference of Weights & Measures) held in 

October 1983, c = 299792458 (m/s) was 

specified as the value of light speed in vacuum, 
after the new definition of the length unit "m" 

was voted through. This was an exact value with 

an uncertainty equal to 0, and an absolutely 

accurate reference value. This showed that there 
were still many mainstream scientists in the 

world had already confirmed that the highest 

speed existed in the universe, and the 

measurement error on it had been very small. 
So, in order to determine its limit value, they 

even intended to risk to fine-tuning the unit 

metering length. That is to say, we have 
confirmed that Einstein used the Lorentz 

coordinate transformation to replace with the 

Galileo's coordinate transformation in order to 

prove his principle of relativity, which was at 
the expense of the truth (the absoluteness of 

simultaneity). So the Galileo's coordinate 

transformations should once again be enabled, 
and the value c of light speed in vacuum used as 

an absolute reference point, which can make 

Einstein's special relativity reasonably to return 
to the framework of absolute space-time. 

CONCLUSION 

The purpose of this article is to restrict those 

authoritative theories by virtue of the truths to 
ensure that they can be applied reasonably and 

credibly. First to put forth an argument, truth 

must have absoluteness and immutability, and 
does not exist in reality. Then, Using Aristotle's 

definition for reference and distinguishing 

different definition domains according to 

whether it exists in reality, all the knowledge is 
divided into three parts, natural science, 

metaphysics and mathematics. Among them, 

materialism can correspond to the natural 
science, and idealism can correspond to the 

metaphysics. The contents contained in the 

metaphysics, such as ontology, axiom, 
postulation, absolute motion, etc., can be called 

as the truths. Which should have absoluteness 

and immutability, and have existed only just for 

the existence of the natural science, but do not 
exist in reality. 

In addition to standing at the perspective of all 

the knowledge and reasonably dividing the 

definition domains, it also points out the 

characteristics of the truths, which cannot be 

proved by empirical methods, and can only be 

gradually approached through long-term 

repeated practices. 

When the frequencies of approach nearly tend to 

infinite, the difference between the obtained 

conclusion and the truth can be arbitrarily small, 

so between the two can be considered to be 

continuous. This means that the principle of 

seeking limits in mathematics was abstracted 

from the physical processes of ascertaining 

truths. 

That is to say, mathematics runs through both 
the natural science and metaphysics, it helps us 
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to break through the bondage of finite thinking 

by the way of infinite subdivision, from 
quantitative change in real space has gone deep 

into the qualitative change of ideal realm. It not 

only has achieved the unity of opposites of all 
the knowledge, but can also make reasoning 

under the premise of mutual restriction 

according to have the characteristic of 

continuity. As a result, the metaphysics has been 
transformed into neither disengaging from 

practice, nor just observing objective things with 

a one-sided, isolated and static way of thinking. 
This is precisely where the bright spot of the 

article lies. 

The truths belong to the category of the 
metaphysics, which do not exist in reality, but 

have continuity with the objective things in 

reality. In this premise, between the truths, 

which can only be reasoned through the 
continuity of objective things in reality, and can 

produce logical causalities, but there can never 

be any chronological order. Moreover, there 
should be no contradiction between the causes 

and consequences of reasoning. Once this 

happens, the reasoning process should first be 

checked, and would try to find out what's wrong 
therein. If there is no error in the process of 

reasoning, it means that there is a problem in 

determining a truth among them, and must be 
corrected. 

For examples, first of all, for the fundamental 

disagreement of current materialism and 
idealism, that is whether matter is the first or 

consciousness is the first, a rational explanation 

is given. Among them, the philosophical 

question of "whether was a chicken or an egg at 
the earliest?" is explained in passing. In 

addition, it was also found that in Einstein's 

special relativity there was a paradox, that was 
to use one truth (the principle of constant light 

velocity in vacuum) to overthrow another truth 

(the absoluteness of simultaneity). After careful 
inspection, it is determined that the value c of 

light speed in vacuum from Maxwell's 

electromagnetic theory has been replaced with 

the value v of real light speed. Here lay 
Einstein's mistake precisely. At last, his 

"principle of relativity" has been modified 

rationally. 
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His famous quote was: “If I have seen further 

than others, it is by standing upon the shoulders 
of giants.” What is "standing upon the shoulders 

of giants"? This article has given the best 

explanation. As the introduction of the concept 
of absolute motion

[4]
, Newton's first law of 

motion can be called as the starting point of 

classical physics, which has been widely applied 
to the physical space in reality, is the best 

example
[9]

. In other words, if compared with any 

one of the "giants" who only confined to the 

physical space in reality, he would be as always 
standing a little higher and seeing a little farther. 

In addition, Newton also believed
[10]

 that 

theological thought and scientific thought were 

closely related and an organic whole, and the 

wisdom in one field could inspire the wisdom in 

the other field. Here once again to prompt, 

theology is metaphysics. It can be seen from this 

that Newton's obsession with theology in his 

later years should be in order to pursue this 

"organic whole", while that was precisely the 

unity of opposites of all the knowledge defined 

in this article. As a circumstantial evidence, 

Newton also developed the infinitesimal 

calculus independently, but because his starting 

point was an intuitive infinitesimal quantity and 

was thought to lack a rigorous theoretical basis, 

so which had neither become a perfect limit 

theory, nor achieved the goal of the above-

mentioned "organic whole". This means that his 

research stopped at the continuity of limit theory 

and could not achieve the goal of mutual 

enlightenment between the natural science and 

metaphysics. With his death, the research has 

been shelved for more than three hundred years. 

And this article is lucky to step on the footprints 

of the great man to continue to explore forward, 

feels more cordial! 
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